



The Law Offices of  
**Randal L. Meek, P.C.**

Attorneys at Law  
A Professional Corporation

Randal L. Meek ○ △  
Barbara P. Hale ○  
Chase Kimball ○  
Amy L. Boettger ○  
Timothy J. Larsen ○  
Kevin P. Dwyer

Admitted in Utah ○  
Also admitted to United States District Court - Colorado △

February 23, 2006

Honorable Glen E. Clark  
350 South Main Street, Room 369  
Salt Lake City, UT 84111

*Re: Chapter 13 Attorney's Fees under BAPCPA*

Dear Judge Clark:

Attached please find a spreadsheet of time spent so far on case number 06-20387, a Chapter 13 bankruptcy case filed after October 17, 2006 under BAPCPA. A retainer of \$200.00 has been paid on this case. This Chapter 13 case is a non-business, straight-forward, chapter 13 case without current or foreseen unusual complications. The spreadsheet will serve as the detail of time spent on a fee application to be filed in this case in the future.

This case was filed on February 15, 2006. The time represented on the spreadsheet represents time spent prior to filing and up to the preparation of documents supplied to the Chapter 13 Trustee.

The §341 Meeting of Creditors is scheduled for March 24, 2006. The confirmation hearing is to be held May 2, 2006. The spreadsheet represents only a small fraction of the time that will be spent in this case to achieve successful confirmation of the Plan and resolution of claims. As of the date of this letter, only one proof of claim has been filed. Many more claims are expected to be filed and will require review and resolution. In addition, a claims review must be filed in this, as in all other cases, requiring further review and time. Also, there will be attendance at the §341 Meeting of Creditors and possible attendance at a confirmation hearing.

It is without doubt that time spent in this case will exceed the current fee schedule of \$1,500 to \$2,000.00 allowed in Chapter 13 cases. It is likely that the time spent and fees will exceed the \$2,750.00 sought for a basic Chapter 13 filing.

This case, like all bankruptcy cases, will require constant attention and supervision to see the case to completion and a fair compensation for such efforts is respectfully sought.

Your time and consideration in this matter are greatly appreciated.

Respectfully submitted,

  
Timothy J. Larsen

Salt Lake Office: 935 East 7220 South, D-100 • Midvale, Utah 84047 • (801) 566-8118 • Fax (801) 566-8244 • Toll Free 1 (800) 640-6110  
Office Also In Boulder, Colorado

Filed: 02/23/06

Web site: [www.rlmLaw.com](http://www.rlmLaw.com) • E-Mail: [lawyers@rlmlaw.com](mailto:lawyers@rlmlaw.com)

Debtor(s): McHenry, Russell and Angela (06-20387)

**EXHIBIT A**

<b>DATE</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>ATTORNEY</b>	<b>PARALEGAL</b>
1/27/2006	Initial Consultation and supply of disclosures (TJL) (1.0 Hours)	0.0	
1/31/2006	Phone Conference w/ client re documentation (TJL) (0.6 Hours)	0.0	
1/31/2006	Check of prior filings (TJL) (0.1 Hours)	0.0	
2/1/2006	Review of documents (tax returns, paycheck stubs, accounts completed bankruptcy packet) (TJL) (3.0 Hours)	3.0	
2/1/2006	Entry of information into bankruptcy software (TJL) (1.5 Hours)	1.5	
2/1/2006	Preparation of Current Monthly Income (TJL) (1.5 Hours)	1.5	
2/1/2006	Review of documents and unmet requirements including drafting letter to clients explaining what information and documentation was still needed for filing (TJL) (1.0 Hours)	1.0	
2/13/2006	Receipt and review of additional paycheck information (TJL) (0.2 Hours)	0.2	
2/15/2006	Meeting with clients regarding statement of current monthly income, budget, review of petition, statements and schedules, tax declaration, and all required documents prior to filing (TJL) (2.5 Hours)	2.5	
2/15/2006	Phone Conference w/ client's payroll department to obtain necessary paycheck information (TJL) (0.2 Hours)	0.2	
2/15/2006	Preparation of Chapter 13 Plan (TJL) (0.5 Hours)	0.5	
2/15/2006	Electronic Filing of petition, statement of social security numbers, statement of current monthly income, credit counseling certificates, statistical summary, disclosures to debtors, statements and schedules, pay advices, matrix, Plan (TJL) (0.8 Hours)	0.8	
2/16/2006	Preparation of documents to be supplied to Trustee prior to Meeting of Creditors, including pay stub analysis, pay advices, tax returns and declaration, property tax valuation (TJL) (1.0 Hours)	1.0	
	<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>	12.2	0
		<b>Postage:</b>	
	<b>Total Attorney Billable Hours (12.2 @ \$160.00 per hour)</b>	\$	<b>1,952.00</b>
	<b>Total Paralegal Billable Hours (___ @ \$60.00 per hour)</b>	\$	<b>-</b>
	<b>Total Amount Requested</b>		<b>\$1,952.00</b>